AGENDA ITEM FOR ADMINISTRATIVE MEETING () Discussion only
(X) Action

FROM (DEPT/ DIVISION): County Counsel

SUBJECT: Weed Control Products Contract

Background: The County issued a Request for Requested Action: Approve contract with Wilbur-
Proposals for the purchase of weed control Ellis for the purchase of weed control products for
products for 2022. Three proposals were received: | 2022

Nutrien - $6,021.71
Helena — 6,257.47
Wilbur-Ellis —5,937.38

The recommendation is to award the contract to the
lowest proposal.

ATTACHMENTS: Summary; Proposals

Checkoffs:
( ) Dept. Head (copy) To be notified of Meeting:
( ) Budget (copy) Teddy Orr

( ) Legal (copy)
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Scheduled for meeting on:  February 2, 2022

Action taken:




Product Container UOM Notes Nutrien Helena W Ellis Nutrien Helena w. Ellis
Clearcast == $ 25600 § 28774 $ 28774
Diuron 41 $ 2200 § 2400 § 2043
Esplanade 200 SC 51,267.20 $ 1,267.20 $ 1,267.20
|Esplanade EZ $ 810 § 8085 S 5861
Frequency 5 62300 5 623.00 $ 623.00
Lockdown SC $ 36290 § 31505 $ 28235
Marix & ; s gos § s 342
Method 24051 $ 32256 $ 32256 § 32256
Oust XP S 2392 5 2880 $ 24.42
Payload/or Equiv lockdown $ 419 5 4180 § 3579
Pendulum./or Equiv 2.5 pal | $ 3656 5 6000 S 3737
Pindar G'T/or Equiv 2.5 pal | Clean Trass $ 13850 5 13850 S 13850
Piper 3750 |ib s 7000 $ 6025
Polaris AC 2.5 pal | . 3 5 6090 $ 11500 S 57.06
Parfolio 4F 2.5 gal | 39200 & 409.00 S 38500
IRejuvia 2.5 pal | $ 99450 § 99456 S 99456
Surflan 2.5 pal | ST B $ [
Venue/or Equiv 1qt aqt |$ 11200 § 13105 $ 103.75
B

Curtail /'or Egquiv 2.5 gal _ Jgal $ 3695 § $ 4248
Escort |8 oz oz ] 207 $ 219 $§ 205
Escort 16 0z 0z 5 207 & 219 § 2.05
GrazonNext HL 2.5 gal | $ 4145 5 5566 S 4252
Milestone 1qt L $ 6750 5 6750 $ 67.50
Milestone 2.5 pal | $ 27000 § 27000 $ 27000
Opensile 12516 |Ib $ 8940 S5 B940 S5 8940
Plaicau 1 gal Joal $ 10300 § 11000 § 9783
Telar |80z oz $ 1085 $ 1270 S 1082
Telar 5 $ 1270 5
Tordon 22K /or Equiv 4385 § 4568 5 4540
Transline 12365 $ 12770 $ 12350
2, 4-D + Dicamba [Weed Master - Rifle [ - etc $ 2394 5 4200 S 2280
2, 4-D amine (41b) Plation - Weedar 64 - et $ 2365 § 2210 § 2011
Iz, 4-D amine (41b) $ 2247 § 2210 § 2105
|2. 4-D amine (41b} $§ 2226 $ 2210 5 1950
HrushRhap B $ 6606 5 5621
Freelexx $ 2550 § 2550 $ 2550
Garlon 3A /or Equiv Element 3A $ 3991 § 4281 S5 3845
M)n 4/0r Eg.u_iv ement & $ 4614 S 4892 S5 4326
Cilyphosate plus (41b) S 4285 § 5 2883
Glyphosate plus (41b) 5 4240 $ .27
Glyphosate plus (41b) 5 3800 § $ 2827
Vastlan $ 9200 $ 9200 5 9200
Vista XRT 5 13400 5 13543 5 134.02
Basal Bark Oil S5 1180 5§ 5 900
Blue Dye |s 2676 $ 4300 $ 2250
[Blue Dye s 2112 § 4150 5 1930
Compadre/or Equiv S 080 S $ 2885
Deposit aid Nufilm (R Grounded - Attach - etc $ 1424 5§ 1922 § 1377
Drift control [cross hair - ot $ 121 5 3wIB § 3535
MSs0 $ 1175 § 1840 $ 1290
No Foam Foam buster - no foam - etc S 2668 5 3000 § 2250
MNon-lonic surf spevader 90 - et 5 1080 § 1743 5 105
Non-lonic surf spreader 90 etc $ 1220 $ 1713 § 1035
Sylicone based surf - - Dyne Amic - Phnse - etc $ 2000 $ 3480 S 2575
Tank Cleaner $ 500 $ 3642 5 1177

5602171 $625747 S$593738 5 33218 5 19376 § 34264

s 33218
5 6,353.89

$ 19376 § 342.64
$ 645123 § 6,280.02




Umatilla County, Oregon
216 SE Fourth Street
Pendleton, OR 97801

Request for Proposal
Purchase of Weed Control Products

Issuing office from which copies of this Request for Proposal (RFP) may be obtained and point of contact for
technical information concerning this RFP:

Theodore Orr

Umatilla County Weed Control

3920 Westgate
Pendleton, OR 97801

(541) 278-5462 Cell # (541) 969-9021
email: theodore.orr@umatillacounty.net

I. Umatilla County is soliciting RFP’s from firms interested in providing the following weed control products and
proposals during calendar year 2022,

2. Products Required:

* Chemicals should be furnished on demand and the County reserves the right to purchase any amount
or none of the amount at the quoted unit price

Container Price Per Total per
Product Size UuoM uUOM Container Notes
(Uearcast 2.5 gal gal $256.00 $640.00 Imox
Diuron 4L 2.5 gal gal $22.00 $55.00
Bsplanade 200 SC 2.5 gal gal | $1267.20 | $3168.00
Esplanade EZ 2.5 gal gal $85.10 $212.75
Frequency 1 gal gal $623.00 $623.00
Lockdown SC 2.5 gal gal $362.90 $907.25
Matrix 1.251b 0z $8.98 511.22
Method 240SL 2.5 gal gal $322.56 $806.40
Qust XP 31b Ib $23.92 $71.76 3 Ib container size
Payload/or Kquiv 121b Ib $41.90 $502.80
Pendulum/or Equiv 2.5 gal gal $36.56 $91.40
Pindar GT/or Fquiv 2.5 gal gal $138.50 $346.25 B
Piper 3.751b b $70.00 $262.50
Polaris AC 2.5 gal gal $60.90 $152.25
Porfolio 4F 2.5 gal gal $392.00 $980.00 Sulfentrazone 4 SC
Rejuvra 2.5 gal gal $994.50 $2486.25
Surflan 2.5 gal gal No Bid
Venue /or Equiv 1qt qt $112.00 $112.00
Curtail/or Equiv 2.5 gal gal | $36.95 $92.37
Escort 8oz 0Z $2.07 $16.56
Escort 16 0z oz 52.07 $33.12




GrazonNext HL 2.5 gal gal $41.45 $103.62

Milestone 1qt qt $67.50 $67.50

Milestone 2.5 gal gal | $270.00 $675.00

Opensite 1.251b 0z $89.40 $111.75

Plateau 1 gal gal $103.00 $103.00

Telar 80z 0z $10.85 $86.80

Telar 16 oz 0z No Bid
Tordon 22K/or Kquiv 2.5 gal gal $43.85 $109.62

Transline 2.5 gal gal | $123.65 $309.12

2,4-D+Dicamba 2.5gal gal $23.94 $59.85 Rifle D

2, 4-Damine (41b) 2.5 gal gal $23.65 $59.12 Platoon
2, 4-Damine (41b) 30 gal gal $22.47 $674.10

2, 4-Damine (41b) 265 gal (tote) | gal $22.26 $5898.90

BrushRhap 2.5 gal gal No Bid
Freelexx 2.5 gal gal $25.50 $63.75

Garlon 3A/or Equiv 2.5 gal gal $39.91 $99.78 Element 3A
Garlon 4 /or Equiv 2.5 gal gal $46.14 $115.35 Element 4
(yphosate plus (41b) 2.5 gal gal $42.65 $106.62

Glyphosate plus (41b) 30 gal gal $42.40 $1272.00

Glyphosate plus (41b) 265 gal (tote) | gal $38.00 $10,070.00

Vastlan 2.5 gal gal | $92.00 $230.00

Vista XRT 2.5 gal gal $134.00 $335.00

Basal Bark Oil 25 gal gal | $11.80 $29.50

Blue Dye 1 gal gal $26.76 $26.76 Turf-Trax
Blue Dye 2.5 gal gal $21.12 $52.80 T e
Compadre/or Equiv 1 gal gal $20.50 $20.50

Deposit aid 2.5 gal gal $14.24 $35.60 —
Dxift control 2.5 gal gal $11.21 $28.03 Reign
MSO 2.5 gal gal $11.75 $29.38

No Foam 1 gal gal $26.68 $26.68 Unfoamer
Non-Ionic surf 2.5 gal gal $10.90 $27.25 Briwsi o0
Non-lonic surf 30 gal gal $12.20 $366.00 Brewer 90
Sylicone based surf 2.5 gal gal $20.00 $50.00 o—
Tank Ceaner 1 gal gal | $5.00 $5.00

Prices quoted must include delivery to Umatilla County if outside of the county and price valid through December
31, 2022. Payment will be remitted upon delivery of the product. Labels for products for which a proposal is
submitted must be submitted with the proposal. Material Safety Data Sheets will be provided with the product when
the product is delivered.



Date: 1/07/2022
RE: Umatilla County Weed Control (RFP)

1. Nutrien delivers all our VM chemicals from our warehouse in Salem, OR with our own
delivery trucks or by common carrier.

Warehouse hours of operation: 6:00 am to 5:00 pm. Monday to Friday
Order Desk Phone: 800-452-8324
Office Phone: 503-304-2070
Office Fax: 503-463-1670

Dennis Capper — Cell phone: 360-605-6230

2. All bulk containers provided by Nutrien will be picked up by our delivery trucks and
returned to our Salem warehouse.

3. Nutrien will pick up any Multiple Rinsed herbicide containers and
deliver them to Salem, OR for recycling.

4. Nutrien can provide Umatilla County Weed Control employee’s product
updates on new herbicides and any technical training needed for the proper application
of herbicides.

5. Price quote is valid through December 31, 2022.
Dennis Capper — VM Territory Manager

Nutrien Solutions
Dennis.capper@nutrien.com



Theodore Orr

Umatilla County Weed Control
3920 Westgate

Pendleton, OR 97801

(541) 278-5462 Cell # (541) 969-9021

email: theodore.orr@umatillacounty.net

Rid Ry:

Helena Agri Enterprises LLC
Scott Tweedy

4802 N Florida St

Spokane, WA 99217
509-961-2621

Tweedys@helenaagri.com

Product Group A Container Size UOM Price per UOM  Bid price per container

Clearcast 1 gal gal $287.74 $287.74
Diuron 4L 2.5 gal gal $24.00 $60.00
Esplanade 200SC 2.5 Gallons Gal $1.267.20 $3,168.00
Esplanade EZ 2.5 Gallons Gal $80.85 $202.12
Frequency 1 Gallon Gal $623.00] $623.00
Lockdown SC 2.5 gal gal $315.05 $787.63
Matrix 1251b Ib. No Bid $0.00
Method 240SL 2.5 gal I__ga] $322.56 $806.40
Oust XP 16 oz oz $£1.80) £28.80
Payload 12 Pounds Ib. $41.80 $501.60
Pendulum/or equiv. 2.5 Gallons gal $60.00, $150.00
Pindar GT (Clean Traxx) 2.5 Gallons gal $138.50 $346.25
Piper 3.75 Pounds Ib. No Bid $0.00
Polaris AC 2.5 Gallon gal $115.00 $287.50
Porfolio 4F (Antares Pro) 1 Gallon Gal £409.00, $409.00
Rejuvra 2.5 gal Jeal $994 .56 $2,486.40
Surflan 2.5 gal |eal  |No Bid $0.00
Venuelor Equiv 1Ot Ot $131.05 $131.05
Curtail/or equiv, 2.5 Gallons Gal |No Bid $0.00
Escort XP 8 oz 0z $2.19 $17.52
Escort XP 16 0z 0z $2.19 $35.04
Grazon Next HL 2.5 Gallons Gal $55.66 $139.15
Milestone 1Qt Qt $67.50 $67.50
Milestone 2.5 gal Gal $270.00] $675.00
Opensite 1.251b |'b $89. 40 $111.75
Plateau 1 gal Gal $110.00 $110.00
Telar XP 80z 0z $£12.70 $101.60]
Telar XP 16 oz 0z $12.70 $203.20
Tordon 22K/or equiv 2.5 Gallons Gal $45 68) £114.20
Transline 2.5 Gallons Gal $127.70 $319.25
2,4-D + Dicamba 2.5 Gallons Gal $42.00 $105.00
2.4-D amine (4 1b) 2.5 gal Gal $£22.10 $55.25
2,4-D amine (4 1b) 30 gal Gal $22.10 $663.00
2.4-D amine (4 Ib) 265 gal (Tote) Gal $22.10 $£5,856.50
Brush Rhap 2.5 Gallons Gal $66.06) $165.15
Freelex 2.5 Gallons Gal $25.50 $63.75
Garlon 3/or equiv. 2.5 Gallons Gal $42.81 $107.03
Garlon 4/0r equiv, 2.5 Gallons Gal $48.92 $122.30)
Glyphosate plus (41b) 2.5 gal Gal |No Bid $0.00|
Glyphosate plus (41b) 30 Gallons Gal |No Bid $0.00|




Glyphosate plus (41b) 265 gal (Tote) Gal |No Bid $0.00]
Vastlan 2.5 Gallons Gal $92.00 $230.00
Vista 2.5 gallons Gal $135.43 $338 58
Basal Bark Oil 2.5 Gallons Gal |No Bid $0.00
Blue Dye 1 gal gal $43.00 £43.00
Blue Dye 2.5 gal Gal $41.50 $103.75
Compadre/ or Equiv 1 pal Gal |No Bid $0.00
Deposit aid 2.5 gal Gal $19.22 $48.05
Drift Control 2.5 Gallons Gal $39.78 $99.45
MSO 2.5 gal Gal $18.40) $46.00
No Foam 1 gal Gal $30.00) $30.00
Non-lonic surf 2.5 gal Gal $17.13 $42.82
Non-lonic surf 30 Gallons Gal $17.13 $513.90
Sylicone based surf 2.5 gal Gal £34.80 $87.00
Tank Cleaner 1 gal Gal $36.42 $36.42

Grand Total $20.926.65

Bid prices are good till December 31, 2022, all prices include delivery to Umatilla County.

Product will be delivered as ordered by Umatilla County, terms for payment will be 30 day terms from the
time of delivery. No charge will be done for bulk containers. Helena Chemical Company can offer various
product in retrunable refillable containers and provide at no cost the equipement needs of the county for

these products. Helena Chemical also offers no charge product technical update meetings to Umatilla County every year
so employees can keep up to date with the latest product information. The estimated value of these training are, $50.00 per
employee. Due to supply issues some product is subject to availability from the manufactures.

- "‘r -
Scott Tweedy

Branch Manager, Helena Chemical Company



2022 Wilbur-Ellis Weed Control Bid

Product Container Size | UOM S/UOM $/Container
Clearcast | Gal Gal $ 287.74 | § 287.74
Diuron 2.5 Gal Gal | § 20431 8 51.08
Esplanade 200SC 2.5 Gal Gal $ 1,267.20) § 3.168.00
Esplanade EZ 2.5 Gal Gal $ 58.611 % 146.53
Frequency 1 Gal Gal $ 623.00] $ 623.00
Flumigard SC 1 Gal Gal $ 282.351 § 282.35
Laramie 1 Lb 1b. S 54.781 $ 54.78
Method 240SL 2.5 Gal Gal $ 322.56] § 806.40
Oust XP 3 Lbs. 1b. $ 24.421 $ 73.26
Flumigard WDG 5 Lbs 1b. $ 35.791 $ 178.95
Pendulum 2.5 Gal Gal $ 37.371 § 93.43
Cleantraxx 2.5 Gal Gal $ 138.50] $ 346.25
Piper 3.75 Lbs. 1b. $ 60.25] $ 225.94
Ecomazapyr 2SL 2.5 Gal Gal 5 57.06] $ 142.65
Portfolio 4F 2.5 Gal Gal S 385.00] § 962.50
Rejuvra 2.5 Gal Gal $ 994.56] $ 2,486.40
Surflan 2.5 Gal Gal N/A N/A
Venue 1 gt Ot $ 103.75] $ 103.75
Curtail 2.5 Gal Gal $ 42,481 $ 106.20
MSM 60 8 oz Oz $ 2051 § 16.40
MSM 60 16 0z Oz $ 2051 § 32.80
Grazonnext HL 2.5 Gal Gal $ 42.521 § 106.30
Milestone 1 gt Qt $ 67.50] § 67.50
Milestone 2.5 gal Gal $ 270.001 $ 675.00
Open_sight 1.25 Lbs. 1b. $ 89.40] § 111.75
Panoramic 2 SL 2.5 Gal Gal S 97.83] § 244.58
Telar 8 oz Oz $ 10.82] $ 86.56
Tordon 22K 2.5 Gal Gal $ 4540 S 113.50
Transline | 2.5 Gal Gal | s 123.50] $ 308.75

Product Container Size | UOM S/'UOM $/Container
2,4-D + Dicamba 2.5 Gallons Gal g 22.80) § 57.00
2,4-D amine 2.5 Gallons Gal S 20.111 § 50.28
2,4-D amine 30 Gallons Gal $ 21.05] § 631.50
2,4-D amine 265 Gal Gal 3 19.50] § 5.167.50
BrushRhap 2.5 Gallons Gal S 56.211 $ 140.53
Freelexx 2.5 Gallons Gal $ 25.50) § 6375
Element 3A 2.5 Gallons Gal $ 38.45] $ 96.13
Element 4 2.5 Gallons Gal $ 43.26] $ 108.15
Glyphosate 4 1b 265 tote Gal $ 28.27]1 § 7,491.55
Glyphosate 4 1b 30 Gallons Gal $ 28.271 § 848.10
Glyphosate 4 1b 2.5 Gallons Gal $ 28.83] § 72.08
Vastlan 2.5 gallons Gal $ 92.00] $ 230.00
Flagstaff 2.5 gallons Gal S 134.02] § 335.05




Product Container Size | UOM S/UOM $/Container
Basal Bark Oil 5 Gal Gal S 9.00] $ 45.00
Blue Dye 1 Gallon Gal | § 22.50] § 22.50
Blue Dye 2.5 Gallons Gal $ 1930 $ 48.25
Compadre or equiv 2.5 Gallons Gal $ 28851 % 72.13
Deposition Aid 2.5 Gallons Gal $ 17.77] $ 44,43
Drift Control 2.5 Gallons Gal | § 3535] § 88.38
MSO 2.5 Gallons Gal | § 12.90] $ 32.25
NO Foam 1 Gallon Gal S 22.501 § 22.50
NIS 2.5 Gallons Gal $ 10.25) § 25.63
NIS 30 Gallons Gal S 10251 $ 307.50
Sylicone based Surfactant 1 Gallon Gal g 25751 % 25.75
Tank Cleaner 1 Gallon Gal $ 11.77] § 1.77
$ 27.940.06

Prepared by Drew Rountree & Jerry Ellis
Jre /7—A—=-‘l-*"-‘l. .*/f' W/ZZ

Wilbur-Ellis Co
PO Box 1648, 599 C St
Walla Walla, WA 99362
509-529-5381




Umatilla County
Request for Proposal
Purchase of Weed Control Products 2022

Wilbur-Ellis Co. (WECO) bid addendums

Wilbur-Ellis will deliver all products requested in a timely matter on Tuesdays and/or
Thursdays of each week (except holidays recognized by WECO).

Accommodations can be met to provide products outside of normal delivery schedule, if
agreed on by Umatilla County and Wilbur-Ellis.

All plastic containers 2.5 gallons and smaller, triple rinsed with labels and lids removed,
can be picked up by Wilbur-Ellis for disposal, free of charge.

Totes and 30-gallon drums, triple rinsed with labels removed, can be picked up by
Wilbur-Ellis for disposal, free of charge with timely notification to drivers (WECO
paperwork must be included for pick-up)

SDS sheets can be provided with products upon delivery (one time only per product)



